
“I’M THRILLED TO DIVE INTO 
THIS NEW ADVENTURE AS A 
JAMFACTORY ASSOCIATE. I 
LOVE EXPLORING DIFFERENT 
GLASS MAKING TECHNIQUES 
THAT ADD TEXTURE NOT 
NORMALLY ASSOCIATED 
WITH GLASS AND CREATING 
SCULPTURAL ARTWORKS. 
DURING MY TIME AS AN 
ASSOCIATE I AM LOOKING 
FORWARD TO ACQUIRING 
NEW SKILLS AND MENTORING 
FROM JAMFACTORY STAFF 
WITH THEIR INVALUABLE 
WEALTH OF KNOWLEDGE TO 
FURTHER ASSIST ME IN THE 
TECHNICAL EXECUTION OF 
MY PIECES.”

@aus_alien_glass

BIOGRAPHY 

Mark Penney is a Tarntanya 
(Adelaide) born glass artist who 
studied Visual Arts at the University 
of South Australia. In his practice 
Mark draws heavy inspiration from 
childhood nostalgia to explore 
themes of escapism though 
whimsical small scale sculptural 
artworks based on the science 
fiction and fantasy genres. Through 
his creations, Mark invites viewers 
to embark on a journey through 
imaginative worlds that help 
distract from the mundane and 
sometimes troubling activities of 
every day life.

 

jamfactory.com.au


